
HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH, JABALPUR 

Endorsement No. B/6600 	Jabalpur, dated 21.12.2017 

The Notification of the Government of M.P. No. F 

4598-2017-XXI-B (1), Bhopal, dated 9/10 November, 2017 

in respect of amendment in Commissioner of Oaths Rules, 

1976 forwarded to all the District and Sessions Judges and 

all the Principal Judges of the Family Court in the State f 

information and necessary action. Oft 

(Vivek Saxena) 
O.S.D. (D.E.) 



f 	
tt; (71) ) 	 liftzt5thl 114144, kiirh 15 1t.D.4( 2017 	 659 

cur:Ex (q) 
P4-cor 

. 	. 
feu 	 faiwi 

Omra Rik, 9/10 1414( 2017 

	

TR.W.4598-2017-54* 	 ) 	*ursr-221 	-‘04tet4 3in4kOlif, 1958 (s6,4141 19 wi 1958) WI 

um 23, fiff4ti Si tndl, 1908 (1908 VI 5) 	UM 139 * 	liffaff %ITU 122 iTtu ug ArFtil litd1, 1973 

(1974 WT 2) WI MIT 477 gR1 51-C8r.  Sae 	31700 4 Et h-q, mt4w2m, p 	•-vigivrc, 	411113 t 	 R, 

Trggf(1, irftr4 Withf ffiitt, 1976 4 AcfreitYrdS 1401R *-171 t, 3014:- 

-(taltri 

B-48 figgil 

ATI 4 if, Vi-filniT (1) if, 	littd ati" * Term It, vr "811 a 	Rid 

frm .7 '4,— 

(1) ay-filic (2) 4, Tri-g* 4, 7m."** ftR" * WWI 	'Era fe" txrdlid f'*1 q14.. 

(2) BtH'irPlI (2) * Trdrd, fiHrofigtr WI-f9TPT tut 

.• • 

	

"(2) BIT-1 	 (2) t oi4d terd fraT qtrtutftsi* an * vfErd *(4 yr,rei ouat, f -er ffErri41/1 
* ofit41 	11111.0 tl 30 143 * tift 	-.414104 * lifT111 &OR TrVjg 	0140. *rad %Irt 

	

SITF8 	'3" .  -4t41104 facia * 	*TO tt 1.T-4 	aus-da * SITIT41-74 	-inarrityl 

1-6t ona•tc t vkIn. 

3. fiztrf 9 if, 3114R 	.at'S "T.15.00" t 121117 xR, SIRR B1 alW "'f.25.00" extRid 1%-xff WR. 

• F.No.4598-201.7-)02-B (1).-1n exercise of the powers conferred by Section /3 of Madhya Pradesh Civil 
Courts Act, 1958 (No. 19 of 1958) Section 122 read with Section 139 of' the Code•of Civil Procedure, 1908 (No. 
5 of 1908) and Section 477 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (No. 2 of 1974), the High Court of Madhya 
Pradesh, with the prior approval of the State Government, hereby, makes following further amendments in the 

' Commissioner of Oaths Rules, 1976, namely:-.— 

AMENDMENTS 

In the said rules.- 

1. In rule 4, in sub-rule (I), for words 'five years" , the words " three years" shall be substituted. 

2. In rule 7,- 

21) 	in sub-rule (2), in the proviso, for the words "thirty days', the words "sixty days" 
shall be substituted. 

• 
(2) 	after sub-rule (2), following sub-rule shall be added, nardely:—• 

• 
"(2.1) Any Commissioner of Oaths aggrieved by the order of District Judge passed under 
sub-rule (2) may prefer an appeal before the High. Court within 30 days from the date of 
order of District fudge. On receipt of appeal, the High Colin may condone the delay and 
order for renewal of certificate of Commissioner of Oaths.". 

3. In rule 9, for letters and figure "Rs, 15.00". the letters and figure "Rs. 25.00", shalt he 
substituted, 

TItirithr * uttmiel *N Iva ofiaxnvic, 
vRw-4t 	dattod 


	00000001
	00000002

